
Name of Bidder Total Variance Award
Prairie Farms/Land O'Lakes 0.2943 11,772.15$  0.2857 5,142.74$  0.3163 39,537.66$  56,452.55$   $               -   Yes
KEMPS dba Cass-Clay 0.3492 13,968.17$  0.3332 5,997.77$  0.3525 44,062.68$  64,028.62$  7,576.07$     No
CASH-WA DISTRIBUTING NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Pints consumed 40000.5 18000.5 125000.5

SCHOOL YEAR 2022-2023
1% Milk Skim Chocolate


